
Academy of Erudition - 1 -

AcadmeyofErudition.com

Name: Date:

Self Laws - Scrambled 
Sentences
I am YHWH: that is my name: and my glory will I not give to another, neither my 
praise to graven images- Isaiah 42:8

The words in the sentences have been scrambled. On the lines provided below each 
sentence, re-write the words of the sentence in the correct order.

1.

“If an ox gore a man or a woman, that they die: then the ox shall be surely stoned, and his flesh 
shall not be eaten; but the owner of the ox shall be quit.” – (Exodus 21:28)

ox shall be surely stoned and his flesh shall not be eaten if an ox gore a man or a woman that 
they die then the but the owner of the ox shall be quit  Exodus 2128

2.

 “Ye shall not eat of anything that dieth of itself: thou shalt give it unto the stranger that is in thy 
gates, that he may eat it; or thou mayest sell it unto an alien:” – (Deuteronomy 14:21)

sell it unto an alien  Deuteronomy 1421 ye shall not eat of anything that dieth of itself thou shalt 
give it unto the stranger that is in thy gates that he may eat it or thou mayest

3.

Leviticus 21:1, 5 And Yahuwah said unto Moses, Speak unto the priests the sons of Aaron, and 
say unto them, … [5] They shall not make baldness upon their head, neither shall they shave off 
the corner of their beard, nor make any cuttings in their flesh. 

Aaron and say unto them  5 They shall not make baldness upon their head neither shall leviticus 
211 5 And Yahuwah said unto Moses Speak unto the priests the sons of they shave off the 
corner of their beard nor make any cuttings in their flesh

4.

“Also on the tenth day of this seventh month there shall be a day of atonement: it shall be an 
set-apart convocation unto you; and ye shall afflict your souls,” – (Leviticus 23:27)

be a day of atonement it shall be an setapart convocation also on the tenth day of this seventh 
month there shall unto you and ye shall afflict your souls  Leviticus 2327

5.

And when ye shall come into the land, and shall have planted all manner of trees for food, then 
ye shall count the fruit thereof as uncircumcised: three years shall it be as uncircumcised unto 
you: it shall not be eaten of. But in the fourth year all the fruit thereof shall be set-apart to praise 
YHWH withal. 5 And in the fifth year shall ye eat of the fruit thereof, – Leviticus 19:23-25

as uncircumcised three years shall it be as uncircumcised unto you it shall not be eaten of But in 
the fourth year all the fruit and when ye shall come into the land and shall have planted all 
manner of trees for food then ye shall count the fruit thereof thereof shall be setapart to praise 
YHWH withal 5 And in the fifth year shall ye eat of the fruit thereof  Leviticus 192325

6.

“neither shall ye eat any flesh that is torn of beasts in the field; ye shall cast it to the dogs.” – 
(Exodus 22:31)

flesh that is torn of beasts in the field ye shall cast it to the dogs  Exodus 2231 neither shall ye 
eat any
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7.

“These ye shall eat of all that are in the waters: all that have fins and scales shall ye eat:” – 
(Deuteronomy 14:9)

have fins and scales shall ye eat  Deuteronomy 149 these ye shall eat of all that are in the 
waters all that

8.

And ye shall eat neither bread, nor parched corn, nor green ears, until the selfsame day that ye 
have brought an offering unto your Elohim: it shall be a statute for ever throughout your 
generations in all your dwellings.” –Leviticus 23:14

selfsame day that ye have brought an offering unto your Elohim it shall be a statute and ye shall 
eat neither bread nor parched corn nor green ears until the for ever throughout your generations 
in all your dwellings Leviticus 2314

9.

For the life of the flesh is in the blood: and I have given it to you upon the altar to make an 
atonement for your souls: for it is the blood that maketh an atonement for the soul.  - Leviticus 
17:11

have given it to you upon the altar to make an atonement for your souls for it is the blood that 
maketh an atonement for the soul   Leviticus 1711 for the life of the flesh is in the blood and I

10.

Leviticus 19:1-2 And YHWH spake unto Moses, saying, Speak unto all the congregation of the 
children of Israel, and say unto them, Ye shall be holy: for I YHWH your Elohim am holy.

shall be holy for I YHWH your Elohim am holy leviticus 1912 And YHWH spake unto Moses 
saying Speak unto all the congregation of the children of Israel and say unto them Ye

11.

“ Only be sure that thou eat not the blood: for the blood is the life; and thou mayest not eat the 
life with the flesh. - Deuteronomy 22:12

the life with the flesh  Deuteronomy 2212 for the blood is the life and thou mayest not eat  Only 
be sure that thou eat not the blood

12.

“But all other flying creeping things, which have four feet, shall be an abomination unto you.” – 
(Leviticus 11:23)

unto you  Leviticus 1123 things which have four feet shall be an abomination but all other flying 
creeping

13.

Ye shall not make yourselves abominable with any creeping thing that creepeth, neither shall ye 
make yourselves unclean with them, that ye should be defiled thereby.” – (Leviticus 11:43)

ye make yourselves unclean with them that ye should be defiled thereby  Leviticus 1143 ye shall 
not make yourselves abominable with any creeping thing that creepeth neither shall

14.

“Of all clean birds ye shall eat.” – (Deuteronomy 14:11)

birds ye shall eat  of all clean Deuteronomy 1411


